0 NO AL WN -~

_
N -0 ©

A DA DD DA DAMDOWOWWWWWWWWWWNDNDNDNDDNDNDNDDNNDNDNNDNN=22=22 A O O A A
O WN 20000 NOOODAPRRWOWN 0000 NOODAPRAWON_LAOOONO O~ W

Sponsored by: Councilmember Ryan Mello
Requested by: County Executive/Planning and Public Works Dept.

ORDINANCE NO. 2021-46s

An Ordinance of the Pierce County Council Amending Title 17C of the
Pierce County Code, "Construction and Infrastructure
Regulations — Building and Fire Codes"; Adopting Findings
of Fact; and Setting an Effective Date.

Whereas, the Chapters contained in Title 17C of the Pierce County Code (PCC)
set forth the County's building construction, fire, and maintenance standards; and

Whereas, these codes need to be periodically updated to ensure conformity with
national and state building, fire, and maintenance standards; and

Whereas, Revised Code of Washington (RCW) 19.27.031 provides that the
State Building Code will now include the 2018 International Building Code, 2018
International Residential Code, 2018 International Mechanical Code, and the 2018
Uniform Plumbing Code, and are applicable to all local jurisdictions in the State of
Washington; and

Whereas, the "International Building Code"(Chapter 17C.20 PCC), "International
Residential Code" (Chapter 17C.30 PCC), "Uniform Plumbing Code" (Chapter 17C.50
PCC), "International Fire Code" (Chapter 17C.60 PCC), "Washington State Energy
Codes" (Chapter 17C.70 PCC), and "International Swimming Pool and Spa Code"
(Chapter 17C.75 PCC) are published by the International Code Council, and should be
amended in order to provide regulations that are consistent with state and national
standards; and

Whereas, any jurisdiction may amend the State Building Code, provided the
amendments do not reduce the minimum performance standards of the codes; and

Whereas, the "International Fire Code" (Chapter 17C.60 PCC) is further
amended to require additional fire protection features to prevent fire spread and
decrease fire damage to single-family development where structures have a separation
of less than ten feet; and

Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council { TN
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 HEAE
Page 1 Of 3 Tacoma, WA 98402




O NO Ok ON -~

W W WWWWWWWNDNDNDNDDNDNDNDDNDNDN_22 A a A A A A A
O NO AP WON-_OO0OONOOOOAOPRARWON_LAOCOONOOOGDWDN-~O©

Whereas, the Pierce County Sustainability 2030 plan promotes the transition to
electric vehicles as a strategy for reducing transportation generated greenhouse gas
emissions; and

Whereas, providing electric vehicle charging readiness at the time of
construction of new one- and two-family dwellings supports increased use of electric
vehicles and is more cost effective than retrofitting a structure with electric vehicle
charging capability after construction is complete; and

Whereas, the cost of providing an electric vehicle ready space in new one- and
two-family construction is estimated to be $50 to $300 per space; and

Whereas, retrofitting an existing structure with electric vehicle charging
readiness is estimated to be 200 to 800 percent more expensive than the cost of
providing electric vehicle charging readiness at the time of building construction; and

Whereas, the "International Residential Code" (Chapter 17C.30 PCC) is
amended to require electric vehicle charging readiness for new one- and two-family
dwellings; and

Whereas, it is in the best interest of the citizens of Pierce County and necessary
and appropriate to protect the health, safety, and welfare of the citizens to adopt these
amendments; Now Therefore,

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of Pierce County:

Section 1. Title 17C of the Pierce County Code, "Construction and Infrastructure
Regulations — Building and Fire Codes," is hereby amended as shown in Exhibit A,
which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference.

Section 2. Findings of Fact are hereby adopted as shown in Exhibit B, which is
attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference.

Section 3. If any provisions of this Ordinance or the amendments to the Pierce
County Code are found to be illegal, invalid, or unenforceable, the remaining provisions
of the Ordinance shall remain in full force and effect.

Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046
Page 2 Of 3 Tacoma, WA 98402




0O ~NOOO A WN-=

N NNMDMDMNMN S A aAaaa a s aaa
AP WN-2O0OOOoONOOOOLEAE WDN - O

26
27
28
29
30

Section 4. The effective date of this Ordinance shall be July 30, 2021; except
that amendments affecting single-family or multifamily residential buildings shall not
become effective until approved by the State Building Code Council pursuant to the

provisions of RCW 19.27.060.

PASSED this A 'day of _Jeun& , 2021.

ATTEST:

%\C@é\ (o Ansa —

Denise D. Johnson
Clerk to the Council

Date of Publication of
Notice of Public Hearing:

PIERCE COUNTY COUNCIL
Pierce County, Washington

YAk,

Derek Young
C ir / U

Bruce F. Dammeier

Pierce Cou Executive

Ap ed \ii-ﬁ- , this
pﬁ% day of F : ;

2021.

Q-mc 2, 0

Effective Date of Ordinance: \Q{; Se Ao 4

Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 3 0of 3

Pierce County Council |4
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 'S
Tacoma, WA 98402 3




O O NO UL B WN B

A DD P, DBDBDWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRPRPRRRPRRRRPRERR
u b wWNPFPOOONOUPDDWNEPRPOOONOUPDWNPEPRPOOOLONOOUPEWNLPEO

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s

Only those portions of Title 17C that are proposed to be amended or necessary for
context are shown. Remainder of text, maps, tables and/or figures is unchanged.

Title 17C

Construction and Infrastructure Regulations — Building and Fire Codes

Chapter 17C.20

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

Sections:
17C.20.010 Adoption of International Building Code.
17C.20.020 General.
17C.20.030 Referenced Codes.
17C.20.040 Creation of Enforcement Agency.
17C.20.050 Appointment.
17C.20.060 Work Exempt from Permits.
17C.20.070 Time Limitation of Application.
17C.20.080 Expiration.
17C.20.090 Building Permit Fees.
17C.20.100 Building Permit Valuations.
17C.20.110 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance.
17C.20.130 Board of Appeals.
17C.20.140 Violations.
17C.20.150 Premises Identification.
17C.20.160 Maximum Height of Buildings.
17C.20.170  Ground Snow Loads.
17C.20.190 Appendix G — Flood-Resistant Construction.

17C.20.020  General.
Section 101.1 of the International Building Code and-shall be amended as follows:

Seetton1+0+-2-Fitle-These regulations shall be known as the "Building Code" of Pierce
County, Washington, and referred to as "this code."

17C.20.040 Creation of Enforcement Agency.
Section 103.1 of the International Building Code and-shall-be-is deleted. See PCC
17C.10.030, "Creation of Enforcement Agency."

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046
Page 1 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0O NOULL B WN B

WINNNNNNNNNNRPRPRPRPRRPRPERP R PR
OWLWNOODUDWNROWVLONOOOUDAWNIERO

17C.20.140 Violations.
Section H3-114 of the International Building Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.050,
"Violations and Penalties."

17C.20.150  Premises Identification.
Section 504-2-502.1 of the International Building Code is amended by adding a second
paragraph as follows:

Signs on private roads shall be installed in accordance with Chapter 10.44 of the Pierce
County Code, "Addressing and Grid System for Pierce County." The premises identification
requirements of this Section must be met prior to final inspection by the Building Division.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046
Page 2 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0O NOULL B WN B

DDA B BEDEDDEDBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
Noup,~,wNPFPOOOONOODULLPAAPWNPRPOOONOULPEEWNPRPRPOOOOLONOULPEWNE,O

Sections:
17C.30.010
17C.30.020
17C.30.030
17C.30.040
17C.30.045
17C.30.050
17C.30.060
17C.30.070
17C.30.080

Chapter 17C.30

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

Adoption of International Residential Code.
Creation of Enforcement Agency.
Appointment.

Work Exempt from Permit.

Determination of Damage.

Time Limitation of Application.
Expiration.

Building Permit Fees.

Building Permit Valuation.

17C30:090—Refunds:

17C.30.100
17C.30.110
17C.30.120
17C.30.125
17C.30.130
17C.30.140
17C.30.150
17C.30.160

17C.30.125

Board of Appeals.

Violation Penalties.

Maximum Height of Buildings.

Table R301.2(1) — Climate and Geographic Design Criteria.

Fire Sprinkler Systems.

Premises Identification.

Garages and Carports — Electric Vehicle Charging Infrastructure.
Appendix E — Manufactured Housing Used as Dwellings.

Table R301.2(1) — Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria.
Footnote "g." to Table 301.2(1) shall be deleted and replaced with the following:

g. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with (a) the date of the jurisdiction's
entry into the National Flood Insurance Program (date of adoption of the first code or
ordinance for management of flood hazard areas), (b) the date(s) of the Flood Insurance
Study, and (c) the panel numbers and dates of all currently effective FIRMs and FBFMs
or other flood hazard map adopted by the authority having jurisdiction, as amended.

References to coastal high-hazard areas (V or A zones) in Section R322 shall be

designated as coastal flood hazard areas zenes-and-anyreference-to-zone-V-shall-be-
designated-as-azeneX-as described in Title 18E PCC.

17C.30.150

Garages and Carports — Electric Vehicle Charging Infrastructure.

Section R309 of the International Residential Code is supplemented as follows:

Pierce County Council
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046
Tacoma, WA 98402

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 3 of 44



Electric vehicle charging infrastructure is required. New dwelling units classified as R-3
occupancies shall be required to provide a minimum of one electric vehicle ready parking
space for each dwelling unit. This parking space shall be provided with a minimum
208/240-volt dedicated branch circuit for electric vehicle supply equipment that is terminated
at a receptacle or junction box within the parking space to allow for future installation of
electric vehicle supply equipment. The branch circuit shall be identified as "Electric Vehicle
Ready" in the service panel or subpanel directory, and the termination location shall be
marked as "Electric Vehicle Ready". Installation shall be in accordance with the National
Electrical Code.

O 0O NOULL B WN B

[
= O

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046
Page 4 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0O NOULL B WN B

A DD WWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNRPRRPERRBRRRERR
NPRPOWOWOMNOODTUNDWNROWVLOMNOUDEWNROWVOLONOODUNWRNLERO

Chapter 17C.50

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

17C.50.020  Authority Having Jurisdiction.
Section 4624-103.1 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.030,
"Creation of Enforcement Agency."

17C.50.030  Violations and Penalties.
Section +62:3-106.0 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.050,
"Violations and Penalties."

17C.50.040  Expiration.
Section +63-3-4-104.4.3 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.030,
"Permit Expiration."

17C.50.050  Permit Fees.
Section +83-41+-104.5 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.070,
Table 17C.10-1-D.

17C.50.060  Plan Review Fees.
Section +83-4-2-104.3.2 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.070,
"Fees."

17C.50.070  Expiration of Plan Review.
Section +63-4-3-104.4.3 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.110,
"Application Expiration."

17C.50.080 Investigation Fees: Work Without a Permit.
Section +83-4-4-104.5.2 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.080,
"Investigation Fee."

17C.50.090  Fee Refunds.
Section +83-4-5-104.5.3 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted and replaced by the
following:

Section +03-4-5-104.5.3 The Building Official is authorized to establish a refund policy.

17C.50.100  Means of Appeal.
Section 107.0 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is deleted. See PCC 17C.10.060, "Appeals."

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046
Page 50f 44 Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0O NOULL B WN B

DDA B BEDEDDEDBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
Noup,~,wNPFPOOOONOODULLPAAPWNPRPOOONOULPEEWNPRPRPOOOOLONOULPEWNE,O

Sections:

Chapter 17C.60

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

17C.60.010 Adoption of International Fire Code.

17C.60.025
17C.60.030
17C.60.050
17C.60.051
17C.60.070
17C.60.085
17C.60.090
17C.60.100
17C.60.110
17C.60.120
17C.60.121
17C.60.130
17C.60.150
17C.60.160
17C.60.165
17C.60.180
17C.60.185
17C.60.190
17C.60.195
17C.60.200
17C.60.205
17C.60.210
17C.60.215
17C.60.220
17C.60.222
17C.60.225
17C.60.230
17C.60.240
17C.60.250

17C.60.030

Code Defined Terms.

Definitions.

General.

Appointment.

Investigations.

Permit Fees.

Commercial Inspection Program (CIP) Inspection Fees.
Building and Fire Codes Board of Appeals.

Compliance with Tags.

Violations and Penalties.

Failure to Comply.

Biodiesel Production Prohibited in Residential Occupancies.
Emergency Vehicle Access.

Fire Flow Requirements.

Minimum Standards for Fire Flows, Water Mains and Fire Hydrants.
Automatic Sprinkler Systems for Group R Occupancies.
Automatic Sprinkler Systems for Other Occupancies.
Sprinkler Underground.

Emergency Responder Radio Coverage.

Fire Alarm Systems.

Gates.

Dry Standpipes.

Planned Development Districts (PDDs).

Subdivision of Unprotected Parcels.

Subdivision Plat Notes.

Road Signs.

Fireworks.

Public Display.

Severability.

Definitions.

Area Separation. Each portion of a building separated by one or more fire walls without
openings, constructed in accordance with the International Building Code, are considered as
separate fire-flow calculation areas. Fire walls are not permitted to reduce the fire-flow
calculation area of dwellings.

Pierce County Council
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046
Tacoma, WA 98402

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 6 of 44



O 0O NOULL B WN B

DDA B BEDEDDEDBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
Noup,~,wNPFPOOOONOODULLPAAPWNPRPOOONOULPEEWNPRPRPOOOOLONOULPEWNE,O

Fire Code Official. Wherever the words "fire code official" appear in the International Fire
Code or this Chapter, they shall mean Fire Marshal of the Office of Fire Prevention and Arson
Control (also known as the Fire Prevention Bureau) and their duly authorized representatives.

Fire Flow. "Fire flow" is the quantity of water in gallons per minute (GPM) needed to
control an anticipated fire in a building or group of buildings or at a facility.

Fire Marshal. "Fire Marshal" shall mean the Director of the Pierce County Office of Fire
Prevention and Arson Control (Fire Prevention Bureau) and their duly authorized
representatives.

G.P.M. "G.P.M." shall mean gallons per minute.

Jurisdiction. Wherever the word "jurisdiction" is used in the International Fire Code, it shall
mean unincorporated Pierce County and contract cities and towns.

New Additions to Existing Water Systems. "New Additions to Existing Water Systems"
shall mean all additions to existing water systems except the addition of one hydrant that will
meet the flow requirement, with no line extension. New additions shall include, but not be
limited to, water main extensions, additional storage facilities, and replacement of existing water
mains.

P.S.1. "P.S.1." shall mean pounds per square inch.

Permit, Construction. "Permit, Construction" means a permit required by Section 105.7 of
the International Fire Code for installation, modification or removal of systems and equipment.

Permit, Prescribed. "Permit, Prescribed" means a permit required by Section 105.6 of the
International Fire Code allowing an activity, operation, practice or function within specified
beginning and ending dates not to exceed one year in duration.

Permit, Renewable. "Permit, Renewable" means a permit required by Section 105.6 of the
International Fire Code allowing a continual activity, operation, practice or function.

Rural Area. "Rural area" means those areas not designated as urban by the Pierce County
Comprehensive Plan.

Substantial Alteration. "Substantial alteration" applies only to structures legally constructed
prior to November 16, 1992, and is any of the following conditions:

1. Residential Projects:

a. Cumulative alteration including additional square footage, replacement square
footage, and/or remodel square footage additien-to an existing building of 50 percent
or more. All square footage included in the building permit application shall be
included in this calculation. Such additions shall be cumulative (toward the
substantial alteration threshold) from November 16, 1992, forward.

b. A change in the use or character of an existing building to a more intensive use
based on the proposed development column of Table 17C.60.150-1.

c. Changing the use of a residential building (home or accessory structure) to a use

requiring a license from Washlngton State (examples daycares, adult famlly homes
group homes etc.). ; v ;

2. Commercial Projects:

a. Cumulative alteration including additional square footage, replacement square
footage, and/or remodel square footage squarefoetage-additionto-an-existing-
butding-of 50 percent or more. All square footage included in the building permit
application shall be included in this calculation. Such additions shall be cumulative
(toward the substantial alteration threshold) from November 16, 1992, forward.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 %
Page 7 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402



O 0O NOULL B WN B

N R R R R RRRRRR
O VLo NOULDD WNEKELO

b. A change in the use or character of an existing building to a more intense use based
on IBC Table 503-506.2.

alterationthreshold)from November 16,1992 forward:
d—Alteration, remodel or structural change to a building, the permit valuation for which
exceeds 50 percent of the current permit valuation of the existing building. Current
valuation shall be determined by the Building Official based on the cost per square
foot values in effect at the time of permit application.
Unprotected Parcel. An "unprotected parcel” is a parcel that is not included in a fire
protection tax district.
Urban Area. "Urban area" means those areas so designated as urban on the "Generalized
Proposed Land Use Map" of the Pierce County Comprehensive Plan.

17C.60.085  Permit Fees.
Section 105.8 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:
A. 105.8 Permit Fees. A fee as specified in Table 17C.60-1 shall be charged for each
required permit. Construction permit fees for fire protection systems shall be in
accordance with Table 17C.10-1-F.

Table 17C.60-1. Permit Types and Fees*

Permit Type Fee*

Aerosol Products Renewable Included
Amusement Buildings Renewable Included
Commercial (Haunted House, etc.) |Prescribed $275.00
School (Haunted House, etc.) Prescribed $137.50
Battery Systems Renewable Included
Candles or Open Flame in Prescribed $151.25
Assembly Area

Renewable Included

Carnivals and Fairs, etc. —

Outdoors:

Carnival — Commercial Prescribed $275.00

Fair, Bazaars, Flea-Marts:

Booths or Displays: 0-10 Prescribed $151.25
11-25 Prescribed $151.25
26 —50 Prescribed $151.25
50 + Prescribed $275.00

Special Event — Outdoors Prescribed $275.00

Cellulose Nitrate Film Renewable Included

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Counci

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 %
Page 8 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402



Table 17C.60-1. Permit Types and Fees*
Permit Type Fee*
Combustible Dust Producing Renewable Included
Operations
Combustible Fibers Renewable Included
Combustible Material Storage Renewable Included
Compressed Gases Renewable Included
Prescribed $275.00
Construction $275.00
Covered Mall Buildings:
Kiosks/Concession/Booths/etc. Renewable Included
Use Open Flame, etc. Prescribed $137.50
Display Liquid or Gas Filled Prescribed $137.50
Equipment
Cryogenic Fluids Renewable Included
Prescribed $275.00
Cutting and Welding Renewable Included
Prescribed $137.50
Dry Cleaning Plants Renewable Included
Exhibits and Trade Shows
Booths or Displays: 0 —25 Prescribed $151.25
26 — 50 Prescribed $151.25
51+ Prescribed $302.50
Explosives Renewable Included
Prescribed $275.00
Fireworks Discharge (1.4G) Prescribed $110.00
Fireworks Display (1.3G) Prescribed $110.00
Fireworks Stand Prescribed $100.00 or fee allowed by RCW
70.77
Flammable/Combustible Liquids — |Renewable Included
Pipeline, Operate
Flammable/Combustible Liquids — |Renewable Included
Store, Handle, Use
Prescribed $275.00
Flammable/Combustible Liquids — |Construction $275.00
Remove or Abandon Tank (First Tank, $151.25 ea addt'l)
(Residential Heating Oil) Construction ($151.25)

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 9 of 44

Pierce County Counci
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 %
Tacoma, WA 98402




Table 17C.60-1. Permit Types and Fees*

Permit Type Fee*
Flammable/Combustible Liquids — |Construction $412.50
Tank, Piping Equipment, (First Tank, $137.50 ea addt'l)
etc./Construct, Install, Alter, etc.

Flammable/Combustible Liquids — |Prescribed $275.00
Tank Vehicles
Flammable/Combustible Liquids — |Prescribed $137.50
Change Contents
Floor Finishing Prescribed $275.00
Fruit and Crop Ripening Renewable Included
Fumigation and Thermal Renewable Included
Insecticidal Fogging
Hazardous Material — Store, Handle, | Renewable Included
Use
Prescribed $275.00
Hazardous Material — Remove, Construction $275.00
Abandon, Tank (First Tank, $137.50 ea addt'l)
Hazardous Material — Tank, Piping, |Construction $275.00
Equipment, etc./Install, alter, etc. (First Tank $137.50 ea addt')
Hazardous Material — Change Prescribed $137.50
Contents
High Piled Combustible Storage Renewable Included
Hot-work Operations Renewable Included
Prescribed $137.50
Industrial Ovens Renewable Included
Construction $275.00
Inspection Only Construction $45+25-154.00
Liquefied Petroleum Gases — Tank-
Install:
0 — 500 Gallons Construction $137.50
501 — 10,000 Construction $275.00
10,001 + Construction $275.00
Liquefied Petroleum Gases — Construction $275.00
Dispensing
Liquefied Petroleum Gases — Tank- |Renewable Included
Maintain
Liquefied Petroleum Gases — Tank |Prescribed $275.00

Vehicle

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s

Page 10 of 44

Pierce County Council
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046
Tacoma, WA 98402




Table 17C.60-1. Permit Types and Fees*

Permit Type Fee*

Liquid or Gas Fueled Prescribed $275.00

Vehicles/Equipment in Bldg.

Lumber Yards and Woodworking |Renewable Included

Plants

Magnesium Working Renewable Included

Motor Vehicle Fuel — Dispensing  |Renewable Included
Construction $137.50 per dispenser

Open Burning Prescribed $137.50

Organic Coatings Renewable Included

Place of Assembly Renewable Included

Place of Assembly —

School Carnival or Fair Prescribed $151.25

Other Special Event Prescribed $151.25

Pyrotechnical Special Effects Prescribed $275.00

Material

Pyroxylin Plastics Renewable Included

Refrigeration Equipment Renewable Included

Repair Garages Renewable Included

Rooftop Heliports Renewable Included

Spraying or Dipping Renewable Included

Temporary Membrane Structures,

Tents and Canopies:

2,000 square feet or less Prescribed and Construction $137.50

2,001 square feet or more Prescribed and Construction $275.00

Tire-rebuilding Plants Renewable Included

Tire Storage:

201 to 2,499 tires Prescribed $275.00

2,500 or more tires Prescribed $275.00

Waste Handling Renewable Included

Wood Products Renewable Included

*The word "Included" in the fee column indicates that the fees for renewable permits are included as a part of

Commercial Inspection Program fees.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s

Page 11 of 44

Pierce County Council
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046

Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0O NOULL B WN B

A P DDA, B DEDDDEDBEWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNMNNNNNRRPRRRRERRRPRPR
coNOUPdWNEROOONOOCDUDWNROOONOU P WNEFRPOOONOUDWNERERDO

17C.60.130  Biodiesel Production Prohibited in Residential Occupancies.

The production, processing or manufacturing of biodiesel fuel is hereby prohibited in all
residential occupancies and their accessory structures. Biodiesel production, processing or
manufacturing in any other occupancy class shall require an approved permit or permits.

17C.60.150 Emergency Vehicle Access.

Section 503.1 through 503.4 of the International Fire Code (IFC) are deleted and replaced as

follows:

A. Applicability. Emergency Vehicle Access (EV Access) shall be provided and
maintained in accordance with this Chapter for any parcel(s) of land improved with
building(s) or facilities. EV Access shall be required for every building, portion of a
building, or facility that is located more than 150 feet from the edge of the driving
surface of a public or private road or shared access facility providing access, as
measured in an approved route around the exterior of the building or facility. If a private
road or shared access facility leading to a subject property is a dead-end longer than 300
feet without an approved turnaround, an approved turnaround is required on the subject
property or approved alternative location. See Figures 17C.60.150-1 and 17C.60.150-5.
When the private road easement is on the property, it is regulated under PCC
17C.60.150.

B. Modifications or Exceptions.

1. Residential: EV Access shall not be required for the following:

a. Residential accessory buildings such as private garages, carports, and sheds that
are 3;000-square-feet-or-less than 3,600 square feet, and separated from other
structures by at least 10 feet.

b. Additions, remodels, or alterations of existing structures if the proposed change
is not a "Substantial Alteration" per PCC 17C.60.030.

2. Non-Residential: EV Access shall not be required for the following:

a. Towers and water tanks.

b. Additions, remodels, or alterations of existing structures if the proposed change is not a
"Substantial Alteration" per PCC 17C.60.030.

c. Agriculture/aquaculture buildings that meet the exemption for fire flow.

d. Structures for the sole purpose of storing mineral products such as salt, sand or rock for
maintenance purposes.

e. Buildings that are 600 square feet or less and meet all of the following criteria:

(1) Separated from other structures by greater than 20 feet.

(2) Separated from property lines by greater than 10 feet.

(3) Not classified as group R, H or I occupancies as defined by the International
Building Code (IBC).

3. Sprinklered buildings or facilities are permitted to modify EV Access minimum
width per Table 17C.60.150-1.

4. When an EV Access cannot be installed in conformance with these standards due to
non-negotiable grades, critical areas, dimensions of the property, or other similar
conditions, the Fire Marshal may allow a modification to these standards. This
authorization shall be made through the "Alternate Methods or Materials" procedure
established by the IFC.

C. Relationship with Road Standards. As depicted in Figure 17C.60.150-1, EV access
standards contained in this Chapter are applicable within and on a subject property.
Public or private roads or shared access facilities that lead to the subject property and

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046

Page 12 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0O NOULL B WN B

A A DDA, PEAEDDWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNMNNMNNNRRRRPRRRRRERPR
O b OWNPFPOOUONOOTULPEEWNPEPRPOOONOUPEEWNPEPRPOOOONOOUPEWNLPE,O

provide access over other properties via easements or County right-of-way shall meet

the standards in Title 17B PCC, Construction and Infrastructure Regulations, and shall

be maintained to standard.

Deviations from County road standards that deal with width, grade, turnaround, or
other access requirements that impact fire department access/ingress and operations shall
require a fire sprinkler system in all homes directly impacted by the deviation. When a
deviation to County road standards that impacts fire department access/ingress is
proposed, the applicant shall provide justification as to which lots are not directly
impacted by the request. The Pierce County Fire Marshal will review the deviation and
provide an approval, a conditional approval, or deny the request based upon the factual
details of the request.

Administration.

1. A site plan shall be submitted to Pierce County in accordance with the site plan
submittal standards for the proposed building permit. EV Access design shall be
identified on the site plan and approved by the Fire Marshal prior to the issuance of
the building permit.

2. The applicant shall have the EV Access constructed in compliance with the
conditions of the permit before the project will receive final inspection approval.

3. Failure to construct and/or maintain the EV Access as approved shall result in the
imposition of penalties under this Chapter.

EV Access Requirements.

1. EV Access standards are as shown in Table 17C.60.150-1 and Figures 17C.60.150-1
through -6.

2. A dead-end EV Access in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with a
turnaround. The turnaround shall be provided within 150 feet of the end of the EV
Access. See Figures 17C.60.150-4 and -5.

3. Bridges that provide EV Access must be capable of carrying a minimum design load
of H-20 per "Standard Specifications for Highway Bridges", as adopted by the
American Association of State Highway and Transportation Officials, AASHTO. A
building permit is required by the County for the installation of a bridge. The County
may require that the capacity of bridges and structures be certified by a licensed
structural engineer.

4. EV Access with a gate shall meet the requirements of PCC 17B.10.102 and
17C.60.205. Gates exempt from PCC 17B.10.102 shall meet the requirements of IFC
503.5 and 503.6.

5. EV Access grades that are 12 percent or greater shall be paved per Figure
17C.60.150-2. When grades are 15 percent or greater, an approved National Fire
Protection Association (NFPA) fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all
habitable buildings, and a letter of understanding provided by the Fire Marshal's
office shall be recorded at the Pierce County Auditor's office. EV Access that
exceeds the maximum 19 percent shall meet the requirements of PCC
17C.60.150 B.4. above and have a dry standpipe installed in accordance with PCC
17C.60.210.

6. EV Access shall not be obstructed in any manner, including parking of vehicles.
Minimum required widths and clearances established under these standards shall be
maintained at all times. Approved signs as guided by IFC Appendix D103.6 or

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046

Page 13 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0o NOYUL DS WN B

A A DDA, PEAEDDWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNMNNMNNNRRRRPRRRRRERPR
O b OWNPFPOOUONOOTULPEEWNPEPRPOOONOUPEEWNPEPRPOOOONOOUPEWNLPE,O

F.

approved pavement striping shall be provided and maintained by the property owner
to identify and prohibit the obstruction of fire department access for:

a. Multi-family complexes.

b. Designated one-way emergency vehicle access.

c. Schools.
d. Land use applications that create nine or more dwelling units.
e. For all other situations, these provisions will be applied at the Fire Marshal's
discretion.
7. Construction of a new building shall not obstruct the EV Access to an existing
building.

8. Adult family homes shall have a medical response access that is a minimum of 5-feet
wide and paved from the front door to the property access or road.

9. For a commercial or multi-family building that is more than 50-feet deep where
vehicular access is not available on all sides of the building, a 5-foot wide paved
walking path shall be provided on the sides of the building where there is not
vehicular emergency vehicle access.

The near edge of the path shall be located away from the building in accordance
with the following:
a.  When the building is less than 30 feet in height, a minimum of 5 feet.
b. When the building is between 30 feet and 40 feet in height, a minimum 7 feet,
6 inches.
c. When the building is 40 feet or more in height, a minimum of 10 feet.
Special Provisions.

2—Traffic Control Measures. Traffic control measures such as speed bumps or speed
humps shall be permitted through the "Alternate Methods or Materials" procedure
established by the IFC. Example speed bump and speed hump designs can be found
on the Institute of Transportation Engineers (ITE) website.

23. Access locatlons %%n—ﬁ&s—éete&mned—tha%a—smﬁ%eeess—&my—b&kﬂpaﬁed—by

feqa&%mulﬁpl%E%%eeess—leeaﬁeﬂs—gu&éed—bylFC Appendlx D104 D106 and
D107 are adopted.

a. Emergency vehicle access shall be constructed as part of the road infrastructure
with the plat or development and meet the following criteria:
1. Gates required at both ends of the access.
2. Locked gate meeting PCC 17C.60.205.
3. A minimum 20-foot-wide paved surface with minimum 2-inch hot mix
asphalt over 4-inch crushed surface top course.
Minimum 20-foot inside turning radius.
Gate shall have a minimum 20-foot clear width.
Minor driveway approaches are required on both ends of access.
Gates to be setback such that they do not swing into the right of way.

oy

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046

Page 14 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0O NOULL B WN B

[
= O

34. Aerial Access. Apartment, townhome and commercial structures three stories and
greater or exceeding 30 feet in height, as measured to the top of the parapet wall or
to the peak of the roof, shall have approved aerial apparatus access roads guided by
IFC Appendix D105.2 — D105.4 and-—See Figure 17C.60.150-6.

a. There shall be no carports, wires or obstructions, or plantings over 6 feet in
height between the building and the aerial apparatus access road (AAAR).

b. The AAAR shall be located on the front door or long side of the building and not
be less than 25 percent of the building perimeter; except group I occupancies
shall not be less than 50 percent of the building perimeter.

c. The AAAR, when not continuous, shall be approved by the Fire District.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046

Page 15 of 44 Tacoma, WA 98402




¥ 40 91 abed 'sg{-1.Z0Z 'ON @oUBUIPIO O} V HAIUX3

NEW-Table 17C.60.150-1. Emergency Vehicle Access (1) Requirements

. Width Minimum Turning Radii
Width - ]
Provosed (minimum (minimum Vertical
Develg ment ADT (2) drivin driving Grade % Surface Clearance . ) Figure #
P 8 surface with (minimum) Inside Outside
surface) .
sprinklers) (6)

Single family home
Single family home
+ Mother-in-Law <12 CSTC (3)
Residential 12' >12 to <15 Paved (4)
Accessory <10 15' With 2' clear [ S 13.5 20' 45' 2,3
S area (5, 11) >15t0>19 | Paved (4,6)
3,600 sq. ft. or
greater
Home Occupation
Single family home 15"if one
+ ADU home is ,
Duplex sprinklered, <12 CSTCB) 13.5

' 1 ' >

=20 L P R 20 43 23
> >
£ both are >15t0>19 | Paved (4,6)
sprinklered
(11
i <
ﬁf)hrﬁ‘; lzrilg;lly 18" wide 15 Paved (4)
<40 20! driving surface 13.5' 20! 45! 2
(11) >15t0o>19 |Paved (4,6)




¥ 40 /| abed 'sgp-1Z0Z 'ON @oUBUIPIO O} V HAIYX3

NEW-Table 17C.60.150-1. Emergency Vehicle Access (1) Requirements

Width Width Minimum Turning Radii
Proposed (minimum (minimum Vertical
P ADT (2) . . driving Grade % Surface Clearance . . Figure #
Development driving | o face with (minimum) Inside Outside
surface) sprinklers) (6)
Cottage Industries
.
@) ) <12 CSTC (3)
<40 20" 18 driving 1"~ 1> <15 | Paved (4) 13.5' 20" 45' 2
surface (11)

>15t0>19 | Paved (4,6)
Multi-family 3 or
ot d‘;;‘gs <15 Paved (4)
townhomes >15to <19 | Paved (4,6)
Commercial Use, <40 24' (7,8) 22 13.5' 20" 45" 2,6
Facilities,
Mobile Home Park,
Condominium Piers
and public docks
&)




¥ 40 g1 abed 's9p-1.z0Z 'ON @oUBUIPIO O} V HAIYX3

NEW-Table 17C.60.150-1. Emergency Vehicle Access (1) Requirements

. Width Minimum Turning Radii
Width - .
Proposed (minimum (minimum Vertical
Develg ment ADT (2) drivin driving Grade % Surface Clearance . . Figure #
P & | surface with (minimum) Inside Outside
surface) .
sprinklers) (6)
Non-residential
Bl Non- <12 Paved
residential picnic —
shelters, playsheds,
and similar 5' medical 5' medical
recreational N/A response response 13.5' N/A N/A
structures intended access access

for public use open
on at least 3 sides
and 2,500 square
feet or less

Notes:

(1) EV access driveway standards are applicable within and on a single lot, and not located within ingress/egress easements. See PCC 17B.10.040 for additional

information on applicability of Construction and Infrastructure Regulations.
(2) Average Daily Trips by vehicle — typical development column shall supereede-supersede ADT for determination of applicable standards.
(3) Crushed surfacing top course gravel.
(4) Surface shall be either Portland Cement Concrete (PCC), Hot Mix Asphalt (HMA), or pervious pavement per the Pierce County Stormwater Manual. Grasscrete

is not allowed.

(5) The cleared area must be maintained on each side of the minimum driving surface, be at the same grade, and be free of obstructions such as trees or large

boulders. See Figure 17C.60.150-3.
(6) These structure(s) must have an approved National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) fire sprinkler system installed.
(7) One way EV access shall be a minimum of 16' when sprinklered, 20" without sprinklers. One-way EV access shall be signed and striped as "Fire Lane — No

Parking".

(8) In order to accommodate ladder trucks, multi-family and commercial structures three stories and greater or over 30' in height shall have access roads in
accordance with International Fire Code Appendix D105.
(9) For buildings more than 50' deep, PCC 17C.60.150 E.9. also applies.

(10) Adult family homes shall have a medical response access that is a minimum of 5' wide and paved from the front door to the property access or road.
(11) Does not apply to structures built in the IRC which are 5,000 square feet or greater.
(12) Grade exceeding 19 percent shall meet the requirements of PCC 17C.60.150 E.5.



FIGURE 17C.60.150-1— Anolicabilitvof Titles 178 and 17C PCC

Apphicability of Pierce County Codes
Titles 17Band 17C

==,

If either L1 or L2 15 longer than
150* feet, EVA per Title 17C is

truck must be able 1o drive
ion where a 150* foot long
o¢ can be stretched around the

Lot 1 )

Eli'lli'l}'. Lot 2

EV Access, within and onNwe
subject property, regulated D
Title 17C.

Private road or shared
Access Facility, located
in an easement, regulated

by Title 17B

* For a sprinklered buslding this distance may be increased to 200 fi

Applicability of Pierce County Codes

wN

2

Pierce County

Fire Prevention Burcas

Titles 17B and 17C

DREAWN BY

kC AFPROVED BY: WW

DATE: July 28, 2015

FIGURE 17C Nmm

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s

Page 19 of 44

Pierce County Council
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1048
Tacoma, VWA 98402




O oo NOOTULLD WNER

B W WWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNRREPRRPRRERREPRPR
OCLOUNUODUNBDWNROWVONONNODUESEWNRPROWVOONNOGOOUDMWNLERO

FIGURE 17C.60.150-1 — Applicability of Titles 17B and 17C PCC

Applacabality of Prerce County Codes
Tithes 176 and 17C
The Emergency Vehicle Access
N e, I (EVA) shall extend to within 150
. feet of all portions of the exterior of
1] Bldmgfacility |4 the building measured by an
¢ : approved route around the exterior
hf_ H of the building or structure.
“
2% If either L1 or L2 is longer than
;U 150 feet, EVA per Title C is
. s required on the property.
Y Fe Track

The fire truck must be able 1o drive
to a location where a 150 foot long

=

L2

L_77

Serving lot 3

EV Access within _»
and on the subject
property, regulated

by Title 17C.

hose can be stretched around the
entire outside of the structure of
sl facility. Lot 2
2
Serving lot | /
EV Access within
and on the subject
propenty, regulated
Title 17C. Fire
11by Took
Serving lot 1

Private road or

shared access facility,
located in an easement,
regulated by Title 17B.

Pierce County Applicability al'PmCo!luy Codes
- - Titles 178 and 17C
DRAWN BY KC | MPROVED BY WW DATE November 2, 2020 | MGURE 17 & | %)

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 20 of 44

Pierce County Council
930 Tacoma Ave 5, Rm 1046

Tacoma, WA 98402



-
v uondo 2
‘[Enuapisay S
0 [BrIawwWo) 10y ¢ uond) pajEisu AP T -I.
WA AP{uuds uouRDossS Y U010 H Yoz M
a1, [euoie sosdde ug s WMo 2
10} pue “[BOUIPISSY 10 ¢ pue 7 7| uondg (€ 5
. =]
105109 D41 2[qe L Jad Wi wnwimgy (g I_u .M.
U Wy
T-0S1°09 DL 1 ML) PUE [-05 1 ONL I AqEL L pM uIy - =
1ad uonannsuod pue FUIDELMS punomsany (| I_| g o3
[ 2]
<] =
SAION] ._|_.= 09 5 09—+ g =
= o
¢ uondp 7 wepdQ 1 uondQ |5
| 5 |-
APPIA U R <
- >
Ips g =
o 4oL
.
=
|_| =
AP N | - 2 §|5
1 =1EE
Qlela
SOIPED Wi VA R m m <
BS 3p (D) 4 T oS
LY ol 2 &
; BRI &
.ﬁr
% I .
P U =
(=)
=N
— (o]

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s

w
[=4
5
o
&
=
c
=
o
o
(1]
=4
2
o

w
=
e
3
[
@
2
Z
]
E
s
o
&
hud
(=]
[}
[+

Page 21 of 44

o
=
=
o0
=2
aQ
o
a
(et



FIGURE 17C.60.150-5 — EV Access Turnaround Options

2Inanans

AU WO ,O€ JO WnWIUIW e pajedo| 2q [jeys punotewny (y
“[BNUIPISIY 10 [RIDIDWIWO))

10y ¢ uondQ ‘pajeisur wasAs wpjuLds v N paaoidde ue
A [BIDIDWIWO.) PUB [BHUAPISY 10}  pue ‘T ‘| suond() (¢
T-0S1°09°DL1 21qe L Jod pim winwiuy (7

"T-0S1'09°DL1 2B pue |-05]°09°DLI 2IqeL

1ad uondnnsuod pue Furdelns punoteuwin J (|

AIpIs Uy

Y oT

4

JIpIA UT

A Y 09 et

&

!

¢ wondo Z wondg

PP TUTA]- e

vov
snipel

winwu .
segap )y s b4

P U N
<

v 09 y

1 wopdq

4[

UIPIA U |

¥ 0t

Y09

==l

R RN

P=—IpIn U

Y09

; fl—4

AIPIA U

EV Access Turnaround Options

DATE: November 2, 2020 § FIGURE 17C.60.150-5

@ Pierce County
Ve Provewioon Ryives

APPROVED BY: WW

DRAWN BY: LR

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s

_— o
mm
o &
CS
£¢
£
I
of
Os
o
8
o8
o

2
5
£

Page 22 of 44



EV Access Driving Lane

N

-

L 3

26' Min.

+

{5 g
=

J (25
g_s
ZE
=g
< =
p&
E
LF
L}

k—h-ﬁn 15, Max 30'

AAAR standards arc applicable for structures thy ane 3 siones or greater, or
exceed 30 in hoight. See Intemational Fire Code J

Overhead ulity and power hines shall not be located
Apparatus Access Road or between the road and the buikjing

cr the Acnal

County Road or standard Private Road

Pierce County

Fire Prevention Burean

Aerial Apparatus Access Roads (AAAR)

yﬁAWN BY: KC

APPROVED BY : WW

DATE: JULY I8, 2015

FIGURE 17C.6, | 30-6

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 23 of 44




FIGURE 17C.60.150-6 — Aerial Apparatus Access Roads (AAAR)

*AAAR shall be located on the front door or long side of the building and be not less than 25% of the
building perimeter; except group I occupancies shall be not less than 50% of the building perimeter.

*AAAR, when not continuous, shall be approved by the Fire District.

“Min 15', Max 30'

AAAR standards are applicable for structures that are three

stories or greater or exceed 30' in height. See International
Fire Code Appendix

There shall be no carports, wires, or obstructions,
or plantings over 6 feet in height between the
building and the aerial apparatus access road.

Pierce County

eree Lo Acnal Apparatus Access Roads (AAAR)
Fure Frouention Burras

WHN BY KT APPROYED [WY: W

UATE November 2. 2020 I'L"':“-'WE 170 a1 800

- =

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pioree © counl (5 2
Page 24 of 44 ierce County Council |

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046  §\¥
Tacoma, WA 98402




O 0O NOULL B WN B

DDA B BEDEDDEDBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
Noup,~,wNPFPOOOONOODULLPAAPWNPRPOOONOULPEEWNPRPRPOOOOLONOULPEWNE,O

17C.60.160  Fire Flow Requirements.

Sections 507.3 and 507.5.1 of the International Fire Code are deleted in their entirety and

replaced with the following:

A. Scope. This Section addresses fire flow requirements for all buildings, portions of
buildings, alterations to buildings, substantial alterations to all buildings, and facilities
hereafter constructed. The requirements of this Section shall supersede any conditions,
notes, or requirements on any plat when the Fire Marshal finds it creates a serious threat
to the public health, safety, or welfare. Nothing in this Section shall be deemed to
reduce, replace or waive any water system requirements in PCC 17C.60.165 or any other
Pierce County Code.

B. Fire Flow Standards.

1. Water mains supplying fire flow shall maintain a minimum residual pressure of not
less than 20 pounds per square inch (PSI) automatically.

2. A Certificate of Water Availability and water system vicinity map that is signed by
the water purveyor shall be submitted at the time of building permit application-

3. The fire-flow calculation area shall be the total floor area of all floor levels within
the exterior walls and under the horizontal projections of the roof of a building with
consideration to the following:

a. Buildings with Type IA and IB construction shall use the area of the three largest
successive floors.

b. Open parking garages shall be determined by the area of the largest floor.

c. Any building constructed in the IRC located within 10 feet of another building
on the same lot shall be considered as one fire flow calculation area unless
separated by a fire wall without openings.

d. Any building constructed in the IBC located within 20 feet of another building
on the same lot shall be considered as one fire flow calculation area unless
separated by a fire wall without openings.

e. Each portion of a building separated by one or more fire walls without openings,
constructed in accordance with the International Building Code, are considered
as separate fire flow calculation areas.

f. Fire walls are not permitted to reduce the fire flow calculation area within
dwellings.

C. Fire Flow Requirements for Facilities. Facilities shall be provided with a minimum of
1,500 GPM for two hours. The requirement may be modified by the Fire Marshal per the
International Fire Code, Appendix B.103.

D. Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings. Prior to the issuance of a building permit for
any building, portion of a building, alteration to a building, or substantial alteration
thereto, fire flow shall be provided in the amount required by this Section. Fire flow
shall be automatically available and supplied at a residual pressure of not less than 20
PSIL.

1. Residential Buildings.

a. Dwellings and Accessory Structures with Habitable Space. The fire flow
requirements for dwellings and accessory structures with habitable space shall be
as follows:

(1) Fire flow calculation area of less than 3,600 square feet shall be 750 GPM
for 45 minutes;

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s . _
Pierce County Council

Page 25 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 go“
Tacema, WA 98402 °z‘;§mno“?:f




O 0O NOULL B WN B

A A DDA, B PEDWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNMNNNNNNRRPRRRRERRRRPR
coONO UL P, WNRPFPOOOOLONODULLPAPWDNEPOOOOLONOUPAPWNEPRPOOOLONOOPEAWNELO

b.

C.

d.

€.

(2) Fire flow calculation area of 3,600 square feet or more shall be 1,000 GPM
for one hour.

(3) When the non-habitable portion exceeds 3,600 square feet, PCC
17C.60.160 D.1.c. applies.

(4) Fire flow calculation area of 5,000 square feet or more shall be in
accordance with Table 17C.60-6.

(5) Structures with a fire flow calculation area of 5,000 square feet or greater
shall be located a minimum of 20 feet from other buildings on the same
property.

(63) For replacement of manufactured and mobile homes in a park, fire flow is
not required if all of the following are met:

(a) Itis alike for like replacement (i.e., double wide for double wide)
including existing approved structures;

(b) The home has a Class A or B roof; and

(c) There shall be a minimum of six-6-foot clearance between the home
and any adjacent home including accessory structures within 6 feet of
the home and any structure on an adjacent space.

Accessory structures less than 3,600 square feet of non-habitable space.

(1) The fire flow requirements for accessory structures less than 3,600 square
feet shall be 750 GPM for 45 minutes.

(2) Exceptions to fire flow requirements:

(a) Buildings set back from all side and rear property lines of at least 20
feet and a minimum of 30 feet from other buildings on the same lot.

(b) Additions to legally established buildings which were constructed prior
to January 1, 2017, and are a minimum of 20 feet from side and rear
property lines and 10 feet from any other buildings.

Accessory structures 3,600 square feet or greater of non-habitable space.

(1) The fire flow requirements for accessory structures with a fire flow
calculation area of 3,600 square feet or more shall be per Table 17C.60-3.

(2) When fire walls without openings are constructed in accordance with
Chapter 7 IBC fire wall provisions-area-separation to reduce the size of the
fire flow calculation area to less than 3,600 square feet, the fire flow
requirement shall be 750 GPM for 45 minutes.

Agricultural Buildings.

(1) The fire flow requirements for agricultural buildings (Group U) shall be 750
GPM for 45 minutes;

(2) Exception to fire flow requirements:

(a) The structure is set back from the side and rear lot lines of at least 30
feet and is at least 30 feet from other buildings on the same lot; and
(b) The structure does not house permanently stationed employees.

Adult Family Homes.

(1) The fire flow requirements for adult family homes going through a State
licensing process or adding any square footage shall be 1,500 GPM for 120
minutes.

(2) Exception to fire flow requirements:

(a) An NFPA 13D fire sprinkler system is installed in the structure.
(b) Ramps, window replacement, re-roof, and residing of adult family
homes.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pieros County Coundil {3
Page 26 of 44 930 Tacoma Av?S.Rm 108 |\

Tacoma, WA 98402 “Fsaw




O 0o NOYUL DS WN B

A A DDA, B PEDWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNMNNNNNNRRPRRRRERRRRPR
coONO UL P, WNRPFPOOOOLONODULLPAPWDNEPOOOOLONOUPAPWNEPRPOOOLONOOPEAWNELO

(c) An existing, licensed adult family home that is altering (adding,
replacing, remodeling) less than 25 percent of the existing square
footage.

f. Special Provisions.

(1) When setbacks are 5 feet from a foundation to an interior property line and
the cumulative distance between two home foundations is not greater than
10 feet, the following limitations apply to second and third story egress/
rescue windows and intervening fences:

(a) Fences will not be allowed between homes where they would front an
egress/rescue window facing the side yard. This does not apply if the
same room has an egress/rescue window to the front or rear of the
home.

(b) Fences will be allowed if they start 3 feet past the proposed bedroom
egress/rescue window.

(c) These fencing limitations do not apply to a side yard that is adjacent to
a tract or other property that is not proposed to have a structure (i.e.,
park, storm, open space tracts).

(d) All developments proposing homes with sole side yard egress/access
windows for rooms will have their CC&Rs reflect these limitations on
fencing.

(e) Modifications from this requirement may be allowed where a NFPA
13D fire sprinkler system is installed in each home adjacent to the
fence.

(2) The following are required when an interior setback distance is less than 5
feet as measured from the concrete foundation wall to the property line. In
addition to the above conditions, the following shall apply:

(a) Side yard walls shall have a fire resistive rating of a minimum of a one-
hour fire rating meeting all the requirements of IRC Table R302.1(1)
and Table R302.1(2);

(b) Sprinkler systems that, at a minimum, meet NFPA 13D or 13R
specifications;

(c) Roof shall be fire resistive materials of Class A, B, or better rating.
Wood or shake shingles are not allowed; and

(d) The only allowable appurtenances into the setback requirement are:

1. Eaves are not more than 12 inches.

2. Gas Fireplaces do not to exceed 2 feet. This shall include direct
vents and gas piping when it is black iron or copper.

3. Propane tanks are not allowed in the setback.

2. Buildings Constructed in the International Building Code and all Townhomes and
Accessory Structures 3,600 Square Feet or Greater. The fire flow and duration
requirements shall be as specified in Table 17C.60-3. Reductions to the required fire
flow are permitted for an approved fire sprinkler system as follows:

a. Sprinkler Reductions.

(1) Installation of an NFPA 13 fire sprinkler system reduces the fire flow
requirement by 75 percent, except for H occupancies which are reduced by
50 percent.

(2) Installation of an NFPA 13R fire sprinkler system reduces the fire flow
requirement by 50 percent.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pieros County Coundil {3
Page 27 of 44 930 Tacoma Av?S.Rm R

Tacoma, VA 98402 s




O 0O NOULL B WN B

DDA B BEDEDDEDBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
Noup,~,wNPFPOOOONOODULLPAAPWNPRPOOONOULPEEWNPRPRPOOOOLONOULPEWNE,O

(3) Installation of an NFPA 13D fire sprinkler system reduces the fire flow

requirement by 25 percent.
b. R occupancies — three or more dwelling units and townhomes:

(1) Attics shall be provided with not less than one-hour draft stops that follow
the party wall line unless fire sprinklered per NFPA. When IBC identifies a
higher rating for draft stops, IBC shall be followed.

(2) Landscaping in tracts or common space that can be controlled by the
builder/developer shall be designed so that it does not allow for fire spread.
All new developments will have their CC&Rs reflect this same requirement
and maintenance.

Exceptions to Fire Flow. The following exceptions apply to fire flow requirements for
new buildings or substantial alterations thereto:

1.

2.

Fire protection credits as described in Tables 17C.60-5 or 17C.60-6 may be used in

lieu of providing fire flow on lots which are one gross acre or more.

For lots less than 1 acre in size, Efire protection credits as described in Table

17C.60-5 may be used in lieu of providing fire flow if a water main capable of

providing at least 750 GPM of fire flow is not available. If the above fire flow can be
provided by the addition of a hydrant, the-a hydrant shall be installed when-the-cest-
doesnot-exceed-thecost-of theereditsinTable 17C-60-5-or a NFPA 13D fire
sprinkler system may be installed if it is not used for compliance with another code

Section.

a. When the lot is served by a private or individual well and Pierce County GIS
data indicates the lot is outside a water service boundary, fire protection credits
as described in Table 17C.60-5 or 17C.60-6 may be used in lieu of providing fire
flow.

When at least 750 GPM for a duration of 36-45 minutes is available from an

approved fire hydrant, it shall be credited toward the required fire flow. The

additional fire flow requirement may be provided by using fire protection credits as
described in Table 17C.60-5 in lieu of providing additional fire flow.-Each-eredit
shal-be-worth-H5-minatesor 250-GPM:

Exemptions from Fire Flow Requirements:

1.

Commercial Bbuildings that are 600 square feet or less, located a minimum of 10

feet from property lines and 20 feet from structures, and not classified as Occupancy

Group R, H, or I, and/or equipment structures and storage buildings, dugouts for

athletic fields, and gazebos.

Storage structures that are used for the sole purpose of storing mineral products such

as salt, sand, and/or rock, for road maintenance, or similar purposes that meet all of

the following criteria:

a. Parking of motor vehicles in the storage shed shall be prohibited.

b. The storage of flammable or combustible materials in the storage shed shall be
prohibited.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pieros County Coundil {3
Page 28 of 44 930 Tacoma Av?S.Rm 108 |\

Tacoma, WA 98402 “Fsaw




O 0O NOULL B WN B

DDA B BEDEDDEDBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
Noup,~,wNPFPOOOONOODULLPAAPWNPRPOOONOULPEEWNPRPRPOOOOLONOULPEWNE,O

c. The roof covering shall be of Class A or B fire resistant roofing material or meet
NFPA 701.

3. Play sheds associated with schools and/or churches that meet all of the following
criteria:

a. Do not require an automatic sprinkler system based on International Building
Code requirements.

b. Open-sided, floor to ceiling, along at least 65 percent of the exterior of the
structure.

c. There shall be no restrictions to egress, i.e., benches, rails, partial walls, etc.

d. There shall be no interior walls or partitions within the roof line.

e. The roof covering shall be of Class A or B fire resistant roofing material.

4. Picnic shelters that are 2,500 square feet or less and meet all of the following
criteria:

a. Do not require an automatic sprinkler system based on International Building
Code requirements.

b. All cooking within the picnic shelter shall be done within approved devices
provided for that purpose.

c. There shall be no open burning within a picnic shelter except within an approved
appliance or fireplace provided for that purpose.

d. There shall be a minimum of one exit on each side of the picnic shelter.

e. The roof covering shall be of Class A or B fire resistant roofing material.

5. Vehicle covers/carports not greater than 1,000 square feet and meet all of the
following criteria:

a. No persons shall be allowed to reside in an RV stored under a vehicle cover.

b. The vehicle cover shall be associated with a residential use.

c. The vehicle cover shall be located a minimum of 3 feet from property lines.

d. The vehicle cover shall be 50 percent open.

6. Commercial buildings less than 3,600 square feet that meet all of the following
criteria:

a. The fire area building is less than 3,600 square feet.

b. The property is located in a rural zone.

c. A NFPA 72 monitored fire alarm is installed in the building.

d. Thirty-foot minimum setbacks to all property lines and buildings on the same
property.

e. Located within a Fire District.

f. Not classified as an E, A, H, I, or R occupancy.

G. Hydrants. These standards shall apply to all new hydrant installations and when
existing hydrants are replaced.
1. The location of hydrants shall be determined by the Fire Marshal, guided by the
following:

a. The average spacing between fire hydrants for construction using the IBC and all
townhomes shall not exceed that listed on Table 17C.60-4. Regardless of the
average hydrant spacing, no portion of a building shall be farther from a hydrant
than that distance listed in the last (far right) column of Table 17C.60-4.
Distances shall be measured along approved EV Accesses and adjacent public
and private roads and shared access facilities.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s . _
Pierce County Council

Page 29 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 go“
Tacema, WA 98402 °z‘;§mno“?:f




O 0O NOULL B WN B

NNNRNNNNRRRRRRRRR R
OV WNRPROOLWONOGOOUVEWNERO

b. For residential buildings, the distance from the center point of lot frontage to a
hydrant shall not exceed 350 feet, except as provided for in G.1.c. below.

c. Hydrants are not required on dead-end streets or shared access facilities not
exceeding 600 feet in length and serving only residential buildings if there is an
approved hydrant at the intersection.

d. Hydrants shall be provided along approved EV Accesses and adjacent public and
private roads and shared access facilities. When practical, hydrants shall be
located at street intersections. See Table 17C.60-4.

e. All new and existing approved public hydrants shall be considered available if
accessible to the fire department by public or private roads, or shared access
facilities, or approved on-site EV Accesses.

Exceptions to Hydrant Requirements. When hydrants cannot be installed in

conformance with these standards due to topography, non-negotiable grades, or other

similar conditions, the Fire Marshal may confer with the local Fire Chief, and may
allow exceptions to these standards by requiring additional fire protection as
specified in the most current edition of the International Fire Code adopted by the

County.

Hydrant Valve Openings. Standard hydrants shall have not less than 5-inch main

valve openings (MVO) with two 2% inch National Hose (N.H.) outlet ports and one

4% inch N.H. outlet port. All 4% inch outlet ports shall have 5-inch storz fittings.

Hydrants shall meet current American Water Works Association (A.W.W.A.)

Standards.

System Design for Automatic Operation. Water distribution systems supplying

water for fire flow to fire hydrants shall be designed to maintain the designed and/or

required water volume automatically.

TABLE 17C.60-3. Required Fire Flow for All Buildings (BH-Constructed
Using the International Building Code, All Townhomes-+2), and
Accessory Structures

Construction Type in accordance with the IBC
IV-H.T. 1IB
DURATION %{%%%{g\% IA and IB ITA and IIA VA B VB
(HOURS) (GPM) WHEN TOTAL FIRE-FLOW CALCULATION AREA IN SQUARE FEET

IS EQUAL TO OR LESS THAN THESE VALUES
2 1,500 500 500 500 500 500
2 1,500 5,500 3,700 2,600 2,100 1,600
2 1,500 11,100 6,800 4,700 3,500 2,400
2 1,500 15,900 9,300 6,200 4,500 2,900
2 1,500 22,700 12,700 8,200 5,900 3,600
2 1,750 30,200 17,000 10,900 7,900 4,800
2 2,000 38,700 21,800 12,900 9,800 6,200
2 2,250 48,300 24,200 17,400 12,600 7,700
2 2,500 59,000 33,200 21,300 15,400 9,400
2 2,750 70,900 39,700 25,500 18,400 11,300

i,yﬁcc.l_co%\

i s T )
Pierce County Council g“ '-.\;l-,;
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 1§
Tacoma, WA 98402 iy 4

[k

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 30 of 44




TABLE 17C.60-3. Required Fire Flow for All Buildings ()-Constructed
Using the International Building Code, All Townhomes-2), and
Accessory Structures

Construction Type in accordance with the IBC

IV-H.T. 1B
DURATION ;ER%%II}}g\% IA and IB ITA and IIA VA g VB
(HOURS) (GPM) WHEN TOTAL FIRE-FLOW CALCULATION AREA IN SQUARE FEET
IS EQUAL TO OR LESS THAN THESE VALUES
3 3,000 83,700 47,100 30,100 21,800 3,400
3 3,250 97,700 54,900 35,200 25,900 15,600
3 3,500 112,700 63,400 40,600 29,300 18,000
3 3,750 128,700 72,400 46,400 33,500 20,600
4 4,000 145,900 82,100 52,500 37,900 23,300
4 4,250 164,200 92,400 59,100 42,700 26,300
4 4,500 184,400 103,100 66,000 47,700 29,300
4 4,750 203,700 114,600 73,300 53,000 32,600
4 5,000 225,200 126,700 81,100 58,600 36,000
4 5,250 247,700 139,400 89,200 65,400 39,600
4 5,500 271,200 152,600 97,700 70,600 43,400
4 5,750 295,900 166,500 106,500 77,000 47,400
4 6,000 GREATER GREATER 115,800 83,700 51,500
4 6,250 125,500 90,600 55,700
4 6,500 135,500 97,900 60,200
4 6,750 145,800 106,800 64,800
4 7,000 156,700 113,200 69,600
4 7,250 167,900 121,300 74,600
4 7,500 179,400 129,600 79,800
4 7,750 191,400 138,300 85,100
4 8,000 GREATER| GREATER| GREATER

I uildines o Firo Dictict 25 saaul ¥: — .

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 31 of 44

Pierce County Council

L o,
j,z‘cc,'_ o%}‘i
gi‘ Wi
930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 ) Ui
Tacoma, WA 98402 iy &4

58




TABLE 17C.60-4

Number and Distribution of Hydrants

Maximum Distance

Minimum Fire Flow Minimum # Of Average Spacing From Hydrant to Any
Requirement (GPM) Hydrants Betwi;lr}l-(ll)f)(;rants Portion of Building

(FT)
500 - 1250 1 700 350
1500 — 1750 2 500 250
2000 — 2250 2 450 225
2500 —2750 3 450 225
3000 — 3250 3 400 225
3500 — 4250 4 350 210
4500 — 5250 5 300 180
5500 - 5750 6 300 180
6000 — 6250 6 250 150
6500 — 7250 7 250 150
7500 or more 8 or more (2) 200 120

(1) Where streets are provided with median dividers or where arterial streets are provided with four or more
traffic lanes and have a traffic count of more than 30,000 vehicles per day, hydrant spacing shall comply

with Table 17C.60-8 on both sides of the street.
(2) One hydrant for each 1000 GPM or fraction thereof.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s
Page 32 of 44

Pierce County Council (
W

930 Tacoma Ave S.Rm 1046 §
Tacema, VWA 98402



TABLE 17C.60-5
Residential Fire Protection Credits

Options to Reduce Fire Flow (1) % of Reduction
NFPA* 13 D sprinkler system 100%
Building less than 2,000 sq. ft. or -45%
Building less than 3,600 sq. ft. -25%
Building less than 3,600 sq. ft and minimum -5%
50" setbacks to side and rear property lines
Accessory or Agricultural Structure Less -25%
than 3,600 sq. ft. without habitable space
Accessory or Agricultural Structure less than -35%
3600 sq. ft. without walls
30" setback to sides and rear property lines or -20%
20" setback to sides and rear property lines -15%
1-Hr Construction (2) -15%
Class A or B roof -15%
100% Brick or Stone or Approved Fiber -20%
Cement Siding-3)

Kitchen Hood Suppression System or -25%

Kitchen Sprinkler Head

(1) Credits used for or with substantial alterations shall be applied to the entire structure.
(2) Consists of type X drywall throughout interior.

3)—At-the-diseretion-of the Fire Marshal:

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Coundil (4
Page 33 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 |

Tacoma, WA 98402  “fsumet




O 0O NOULL B WN K-

NNNNNNNNNNRPRRREPRPERP R PR
OO NOOUDWNROWVONOOUDSWNERO

TABLE 17C.60-6
Residential Fire Protection Credits - Greater than 5,000 Square Feet
Options to Reduce Fire Flow (1, 2, 3) % of Reduction
NFPA 13 D sprinkler system (1) -50%
Building less than 7,500 sq. ft. or -25%
Building less than 10,000 sq. ft. -20%
Sprinkler Protection Provided in the Garage -25%
Sprinkler Protection Provided in the Attic (can only be used if garage -25%
protection is also used.)
50" setback to sides and rear property lines or -25%
30" setback to sides and rear property lines -20%
Existing Hydrant — Minimum 750 gpm/45 min or -25%
Existing Hydrant - Minimum 1,000 gpm/60 min -50%

(1) Installation of the NFPA 13D fire sprinkler system is always required when using this Table.

(2) For lots less than an acre in size where a main capable of supplying 750 gpm/45 minutes is available, a
hydrant is required in accordance with PCC 17C.60.160 G.1.b. or 17C.60.160 G.1.c.

(3) Structure shall be located a minimum of 20' from other buildings on the same property.

17C.60.165 Minimum Standards for Fire Flows, Water Mains and Fire Hydrants.
A. The purpose of this Section is to establish minimum fire flow requirements for land
development and for all new and expanding public water systems in Pierce County.
These fire flow requirements shall better protect the residents, inhabitants, commercial
developments, and industrial developments in Pierce County against the dangers of fire
due to the inadequacy of water and the inadequacy of water pressure.
Nothing in this Chapter shall be deemed to reduce, replace, or waive any
requirement set forth in PCC 17C.60.160.
B. General Applicability. The following shall be subject to the requirements of this
Chapter:
Proposed subdivisions;
Proposed mobile home parks;
New water systems or new additions to existing systems;
Planned development districts;
Binding site plans;
Short subdivisions;
Large lot divisionss;
Plat amendments; and
9. Plat alterations.
C. Fire Flow and Water System Requirements.
1. The following activities and systems are exempt from the fire flow and water system
requirements set forth in subsection 2. below.
a. Activities identified in subsection D. shall be subject to the requirements of D.
only.
b. New water systems or new additions to existing systems when all lots to be
served by such new system or new addition are one gross acre or more in size
and uses are limited to single family residential.

o S e

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s _ L A
Pierce County Council /| (gt

Page 34 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1048 j. 5l

Tacoma, WA 98402 Sy



No o~ WwWwN -

2. Except as provided in subsection 1. above, the following fire flow and water system

requirements apply to those activities identified in subsections B.1. through 6.

a. Minimum fire flow and hydrant spacing requirements. Tables 17C.60-7 and
17C.60-8 set forth minimum fire flow and hydrant spacing requirements. Actual
fire flow and hydrant spacing requirements shall be determined in accordance
with PCC 17C.60.160 when application is made for a building permit.

TABLE 17C.60-7
Minimum Fire Flow Requirements
Type of I .y Fire Flow Required | Minimum Duration
Development (G.P.M) (1,2) (minutes)
One- and Two-Family [Urban-and Rural 750 45
Multi-family Urban 1,500 60-120
Multi-family Rural 750 45
Commercial Usban 1,500 60-120
Commercial Rural 750 45
Industrial Prban-and Rural 2,000 120

(1) Water systems serving multiple properties shall provide a minimum of 1,500 GPM for 120 minutes.
(2) This table represents the mlmmums for comphance w1th land subd1v1s1on Bﬂi—ld:mg—aﬁd—ﬁaeﬂﬂ:y—
PMSpecific fire
ﬂow requlrements for a bulldlng w111 be determmed at time of apphcatlon for building permits.

TABLE 17C.60-8
Maximum Hydrant Spacing Based on Minimum Fire Flow
Requirements

Minimum Fire Flow Average Spacing Between
Requirement (G.P.M.) Hydrants (1, 2, 3) (FT.)

750 700
1,500 500

2,000 450

(1) Hydrants shall be provided along adjacent public and private roads. When
practical, hydrants shall be located at street intersections.

(2) On dead-end streets and roadways not exceeding 600 feet in length and
serving property designated to be used for one- or two-family dwellings there
need not be hydrants located on said dead-end street or roadway if there is an
approved hydrant at the intersection.

(3) Where streets are provided with median dividers or where arterial streets are
provided with four or more traffic lanes and have a traffic count of more than
30,000 vehicles per day, hydrant spacing shall comply with Table 17C.60-8
on both sides of the street.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s . LA N
Pierce County Council i N

Page 35 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 \\QUI)

Tacoma, WA 98402 W,,,mﬂ‘f

e



O 0O NOULL B WN B

A A DDA, B PEDWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNMNNNNNNRRPRRRRERRRRPR
coONO UL P, WNRPFPOOOOLONODULLPAPWDNEPOOOOLONOUPAPWNEPRPOOOLONOOPEAWNELO

b. Mains. New or replaced water mains shall be a minimum of 8 inches in diameter
for dead ends, and 6 inches for circulating mains, provided that for dead end cul-
de-sacs, an 8-inch main need only extend to the last required fire hydrant and
domestic mains may be installed thereafter to the remaining residences. Hydrant
leads less than 50 feet may be 6 inches in diameter. A dead end main which
extends across a street only for the purpose of serving a hydrant shall be of a size
capable of providing the required fire flow, but it shall not be less than 6 inches
in diameter. All mains shall have hydrants and/or tees and valves installed to
conform with this regulation, except that no hydrants, tees or valves shall be
required along transmission mains. Any service connection made to a
transmission main shall require that a hydrant be installed. Any extension that is
more than 350 feet shall require an 8-inch main or a 6-inch loop.

When existing water mains are replaced, new water mains shall be sized in
compliance with this regulation, but there shall be no requirement to replace the
entire system to meet minimum fire flow requirements.

c. Hydrants. This standard shall apply to all new hydrant installations and when
existing hydrants are replaced on public water systems required to provide fire
flow. Standard hydrants shall have not less than 5-inch main valve openings
(MVO) with two 2/2-inch National Hose (N.H.) outlet ports and one 4'2-inch
N.H. outlet port. All 2's-inch ports and the 4)%-inch outlet ports shall have
threads that correspond with and meet the approval of the affected fire
department.

All new hydrants and replaced hydrants shall be provided with 5-inch storz
fittings. Hydrants shall meet the current A.W.W.A. standards.

(1) Hydrant Locations. Hydrant locations shall be determined by the Fire
Marshal, guided by the maximum spacing indicated by Table 17C.60-8.

(2) Auxiliary gate valve. There shall be an auxiliary gate valve installed to
permit the repair and replacement of the hydrants without disruption of
water service.

(3) Setup. Hydrants shall stand plumb and be set to the finished grade. The
bottom of the lowest outlet of the hydrant shall be no less than 18 inches
above the grade. There shall be 36 inches of clear area around the hydrant
for operation of a hydrant wrench on the outlets and on the control valve.
The pumper port shall face the street. Where the street cannot be clearly
defined or recognized, the port shall face the most likely route of approach
and the location of the fire truck while pumping, as determined by the Fire
Marshal.

(4) Accessibility. Hydrants shall be accessible for fire department pumpers.

(5) Plans. The location of all water mains, fire hydrants, and valves to be
installed shall be properly and accurately marked on identifiable plans or
drawings. Plans or drawings shall be furnished to the Fire Marshal for
review and approval.

(6) Color Coding. Color coding, when used, shall be in accordance with NFPA
291.

D. Requirements for Large Lot Divisions, One Acre Short Subdivisions and One Acre
Formal Subdivisions (Residential).

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s . _
Pierce County Council

Page 36 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 go“
Tacema, WA 98402 °z‘;§mno“?:f




O 0O NOULL B WN B

A A DDA, PEAEDDWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNMNNMNNNRRRRPRRRRRERPR
O b OWNPFPOOUONOOTULPEEWNPEPRPOOONOUPEEWNPEPRPOOOONOOUPEWNLPE,O

2—Prior to preliminary plat or preliminary plan approval, the applicant shall submit to
the Fire Marshal a Certificate of Water Availability and water system vicinity map
from the water purveyor addressing its willingness and ability to satisfy the
requirements of this regulation.
a. Ifthere is a water main capable of providing fire flow at any portion of the
property street frontage on the access side(s) of the proposed development, a
hydrant shall be prov1ded at the entrance(s) to the development I—H—&dd-l-t—l-eﬂ—lf—

2. Prior to the approval of any large lot division, short subdivision where each lot is one
gross acre or more, or formal subdivision where each lot is one gross acre or more
and limited to single-family residential use, the following statement shall be affixed
on the face of the plat:

Fire flow and/or fire protection requirements shall be determined at the time of
application for building permit.
E. Procedures for Compliance. The following shall be required for those activities
identified in PCC 17C.60.165 B.1. through 6. and D.2.a-b.:

1. Prior to preliminary plat or preliminary plan approval, the applicant shall submit to
the Fire Marshal a Certificate of Water Availability and water system vicinity map
from the water purveyor addressing its willingness and ability to satisfy the

requirements of this Regulation. The-Fire- Marshal-may-extend-thisrequirement-to-
prier-to-final plat-approval

2. Prior to final plat, final short plat or final plan approval, the following shall be
required:

a. Water system plans and specifications which comply with these Regulations
shall be designed and stamped by a registered professional engineer. Said plans
shall be signed by the purveyor and shall be filed with the Fire Marshal.

b. Water system plans shall be approved in writing by the Fire Marshal.

c. The approved water system shall be installed prior to final plat, final short plat or
final plan approval provided that this requirement can be waived if a bond or
other security is posted and approved prior to said approval. Bonded
improvements shall be constructed within two years of final plat or final plan
approval. The form of security, if other than a bond, shall be approved by the
Prosecuting Attorney's Office. The amount of the bond or security shall be
determined by the contractor who shall install the system. The bond or other
security shall be issued to Pierce County and shall be approved by the Fire
Marshal.

d. Electronic "as built" drawings, flow test results showing the amount of fire flow
available at 20 P.S.1., and a Certificate of Water Availability signed for final by
the water purveyor shall be filed with the Fire Marshal.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s . _
Pierce County Council

Page 37 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 go“
Tacema, WA 98402 °z‘;§mno“?:f




O 0O NOULL B WN B

DDA B BEDEDDEDBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
Noup,~,wNPFPOOOONOODULLPAAPWNPRPOOONOULPEEWNPRPRPOOOOLONOULPEWNE,O

3. When the distribution system is installed, said installation shall be under the
direction of a registered professional engineer who shall certify the construction of
the system is in accordance with the approved design. In the event a bond is posted,
installation of the system shall be completed and operable, in accordance with this
Regulation, prior to occupancy or any other use of any structure.

F. Purveyor Requirements.

1. All purveyors shall comply with the Pierce County Coordinated Water System Plan.

2. Maintenance and testing of private water systems per NFPA 25 are the responsibility
of the property owner. Required inspection and test records shall be provided to the
Fire Marshal.

17C.60.180  Automatic Sprinkler Systems for Group R Occupancies.
Section 903.2.8.1 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

903.2.8.1 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3
shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area. Approved automatic
sprinkler systems shall be installed in any structure containing three or more townhouse
units.

17C.60.185  Automatic Sprinkler Systems for Other Occupancies.

A. One- and Two-Family Dwellings. Section R313.2 of the International Residential Code
is adopted and modified as follows. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall
be installed in one- and two-family dwellings that meet any of the following:

1. Fire flow calculation area exceeding 5,000 square feet;
Located on an unprotected parcel;
Located in Fire District 25 or Fire District 26; er
Any structure containing three or more townhouse units;
Located on Raft Island, Herron Island, Harstine Island, Tanglewood Island, or
Ketron Island; or
6. Less than a 5-foot setback to a property line.
B. Accessory Structures. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in
new accessory structures with a fire flow calculation area exceeding 5,000 square feet.
C. Commercial. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in new
commercial buildings that meet any of the following:
1. Located in Fire District 25 or Fire District 26;-ot
2. Located on an unprotected parcel and not meeting one of the criteria found in PCC
17C.60.160 B3F=;
3. Installation of fire sprinklers were a condition of a land use application; or
4. Located on Raft Island, Herron Island, Harstine Island, Tanglewood Island, or
Ketron Island.
D. Special Provisions.
1. One-and Two-Family Dwellings with a fire flow calculation area of 5,000 square
feet or more shall comply with Table 17C.60-6.
2. Parcels with three dwelling units shall have an approved fire sprinkler system
installed and meet 17C.60.160.
a. Exception: Legally existing mobile home parks.

- Ealiadh i

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pieros County Coundil {3
Page 38 of 44 930 Tacoma Av?S.Rm 108 |\

Tacoma, WA 98402 “Fsaw




O 0o NOYUL DS WN B

DDA BB DEDDEDBEBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
NoOoOouuph,wWNEPOOONOULPAWNPEPERPOOONOUPEWNPERPOOONOOUPEWNEDO

3. Parcels with four or more dwelling units shall have an approved fire sprinkler system
installed and meet PCC 17C.60.160 D.1.a.
a. Exception: Legally existing mobile home parks.
E. Existing Buildings. When a fire sprinkler system is required by PCC 17C.60.185 A.-D.
or Table 17C.60.160-6, the following provisions apply to existing buildings.

1. Effective January 1, 2017, a one-time alteration, including additional square footage,
replacement square footage, and/or remodel square footage of up to 500 square feet,
is allowed before sprinklers are required by PCC 17C.60.185 A. and PCC
17C.60.185 B. or Table 17C.60.160-6.

2. For a building that meets PCC 17C.60.185 A.-D. or Table 17C.60.160-6 and does
not meet PCC 17C.60.185 E.1., sprinkler protection shall be required as follows:

a. The kitchen(s) shall be provided with either a kitchen hood suppression system
or a kitchen sprinkler head.

b. If an addition is proposed, the addition shall be provided with sprinkler
protection if it is not exempt from sprinkler protection under the applicable
NFPA 13 standard. If the addition is exempt from sprinkler protection under the
applicable NPFA 13 standard, a single head shall be provided at the transition
between the addition and the existing.

c. Any area being remodeled where sheetrock is being added/removed/relocated
shall be provided with sprinkler protection.

3. Sprinkler systems required by PCC 17C.60.185 D.2. or PCC 17C.60.185 D.3. shall
be required in the building that is being permitted. Installation of fire sprinkler
systems in dwellings that are not in for a building permit are not required by this
Section.

4. A substantial alteration requires installation of the approved fire sprinkler system in
accordance with the applicable NPFA 13 standard.

17C.60.190  Sprinkler Underground.
A. Fire Department Connections. Fire Department Connections shall be installed in an
approved location with the following considerations:
Within 25 feet of a fire hydrant.
On the same side of the emergency vehicle access as the hydrant.
Not in a collapse zone.
Locking caps required.
Minimum of 50 ft from structure.
Clustered when possible.

N s> =

17C.60.195 Emergency Responder Radio Coverage.
A. Emergency Responder Radio Coverage — New Buildings. Emergency responder radio

coverage requirements apply to new buildings where any of the following are met:
1. Classified as an H or I occupancy;

The fire area is 12,000 square feet or greater;

There are more than two stories above grade plane;

The building has a basement;

The building is equipped with a photovoltaic system; or

Radio coverage signal strength levels are not consistent with the minimum levels set

forth in IFC Section 510.

NSNS

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce Gounty Councl Ay
Page 39 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 %}

/i
Tacoma, WA 98402  finmeeicy




O 0o NOYUL DS WN B

A A DDA, PEAEDDWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNMNNMNNNRRRRPRRRRRERPR
O b OWNPFPOOUONOOTULPEEWNPEPRPOOONOUPEEWNPEPRPOOOONOOUPEWNLPE,O

Testing is required for items 1-4. Item 5 is assumed to be compliant in buildings that
do not meet any of the 1-4 criteria unless the Fire Departments have reported a
deficiency.

B. Emergency Responder Radio Coverage — Existing Buildings. When a building permit
application is submitted in an existing multi-tenant building that requires testing, the
building owner is responsible for contracting the testing and submitting the results prior
to occupancy. Emergency responder radio coverage requirements apply to existing
buildings where any of the following are met:

1. A building permit is submitted to Pierce County and any of the following are met:
a. Classified as an H or I occupancy;
b. The building is 12,000 square feet or greater;

There are more than two stories above grade plane;

The building has a basement;

The building is equipped with a photovoltaic system; or

Radio coverage signal strength levels are not consistent with the minimum levels

set forth in IFC Section 510.

Testing is required for items 1-4. Item 5 is assumed to be compliant in buildings
that do not meet any of the 1-4 criteria unless the Fire Departments have reported a
deficiency.

2. The local fire district has reported a deficiency.

o Ao

17C.60.200  Fire Alarm Systems.
A. New fire alarm systems shall be addressable.
B. A fire alarm panel replacement shall be with an addressable panel and meet the
installation requirements of the current International Fire Code for the occupancy
served.

17C.60.205  Gates.
A. A gate serving a commercial facility or building is required to be an electric gate
equipped with Opticom.
B. A gate serving five or more residential lots is required to be an electric gate equipped
with Opticom.
C. When a manual gate is allowed it shall be equipped with a 1650 Knox box installed on
the right side of the gate.

17C.60.210  Dry Standpipes.

When a dry standpipe is required for a residential structure, it shall be designed and installed
in accordance with the following:
Hydraulically designed to provide a minimum of 750 gpm @ 250 psi.
The standpipe shall be designed by a Washington State Level 3 license holder or a PE.
In a location approved by Fire Prevention and the local fire district.
A 5" Storz Fire Department Connection on the supply side and a roof top connection (3
each 2 4" gated with cap) on the discharge.
Locking caps required on the supply side.

ocawpy

=

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pieros County Coundil {3
Page 40 of 44 930 Tacoma Av?S.Rm R

Tacoma, VA 98402 s




O 0o NOYUL DS WN B

DDA B BEDEDDEDBWWWWWWWWWWNNNNNNNNNNNRRRPRPRRRERRPR
Nouph,wWNREFRPOOONOULPAWNPERPOOONOUPEEWNPRERPOOONOOUPE WNEDO

17C.60.215  Planned Development Districts (PDDs).
The following criteria apply to Planned Development Districts:

A.

When the PDD allows an interior setback distance that is less than 5 feet as measured
from the concrete foundation wall to the property line, or less than 10 feet between
buildings on the same property, all of the following shall apply:
1. Buildings using the PDD reduced setback require installation of fire sprinkler
systems.
2. The exterior siding shall consist of brick, stone, or approved fiber cement siding.
3. A second story rescue access that fronts on a public space shall be provided.
4. Improvements within the side yards shall be limited:
a. Eaves shall not exceed 12 inches.
b. The necessary distance required to install a gas fireplace not to exceed 2 feet, this
shall include direct vents and gas piping when it is black iron or copper.
c. Propane tanks are not allowed in the 5-foot setback or between buildings.
d. Fences and hedges are prohibited between buildings.
When the PDD proposes to use neighborhood street/access lanes/alleys or any deviations
to Pierce County road standards that affect EV access the following are required:
1. Installation of fire sprinkler systems in affected lots within the PDD.
When the PDD proposes multiple single-family detached dwelling units without
property lines the following are required:
1. Installation of fire sprinkler systems in all lots within the PDD.
2. The exterior siding shall consist of brick, stone, or approved fiber cement siding.
3. A second story rescue access that fronts on a public space shall be provided.
4. Improvements within the side yards shall be limited:
a. Eaves shall not exceed 12 inches.
b. The necessary distance required to install a gas fireplace not to exceed 2 feet, this
shall include direct vents and gas piping when it is black iron or copper.
c. Propane tanks are not allowed in the 5-foot setback or between buildings.
d. Fences and hedges are prohibited between buildings.

17C.60.220  Subdivision of Unprotected Parcels.
Subdivision of unprotected parcels is prohibited.

17C.60.222  Subdivision Plat Notes.
The following notes shall be on the face of the plat and in the CC&Rs:

A.

"When setbacks are 5 feet from a foundation to an interior property line, and the
cumulative distance between two home foundations is not greater than 10 feet, the
following limitations apply to second and third story egress/rescue windows and
intervening fences:

1. Fences will not be allowed between homes where they would front an egress/rescue
window facing the side yard. This does not apply if the same room has an
egress/rescue window to the front or rear of the home.

2. Fences will be allowed if they start 3 feet past the proposed bedroom egress/rescue
window.

3. These fencing limitations do not apply to a side yard that is adjacent to a tract or
other property that is not proposed to have a structure (i.e., park, storm, open space
tracts).

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s _ A
Pierce County Council [

Page 41 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1048 4\ i

Tacoma, WA 98402 '*?.,t;,l,l!‘,.ﬂg:??-’




O 0O NOULL B WN B

NNNNRNNNNRRRRRRRRR R
NOUDSWNROOONOGOUVEWNIERO

N
(o]

4. Modifications from this requirement may be allowed where a NFPA 13D fire
sprinkler system is installed in each home adjacent to the fence."

B. Prior to the approval of any large lot division, short subdivision where each lot is one
gross acre or more, or formal subdivision where each lot is one gross acre or more and
limited to single-family residential use, the following statement shall be affixed on the
face of the plat:

"Fire flow and/or fire protection requirements shall be determined at the time of
application for building permit."

C. For land use applications that create 9 or more dwelling units the following note is
required:

"No parking shall be allowed in the fire lane." Approved signs as guided by IFC
Appendix D103.6 or approved pavement striping shall be provided and maintained
by the property owner to identify and prohibit the obstruction of fire department
access.

D. Landscaping in tracts or common space that can be controlled by the builder/developer
shall be designed so that it does not allow for fire spread. All new developments will
have their CC&Rs reflect this same requirement and maintenance.

17C.60.225  Road Signs.

All private roads must have private road name signs that meet the requirements outlined in
this Title and the "Manual on Design Guidelines and Specifications for Road and Bridge
Construction in Pierce County". All private roads shall be named and/or numbered in accordance

with Chapter 10.44 PCC.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Coundil
Page 42 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046

Tacoma, WA 98402 “Fsaw




O 0O NOULL B WN B

N R R R R RRRRRR
O VLo NOULDD WNEKELO

Chapter 17C.70

WASHINGTON STATE ENERGY CODES

17C.70.010  Adoption of Washington State Energy Code.

The edition of the Washington State Energy Code currently or hereafter adopted and
amended by the State Building Code Council and included in Chapters 51-11C and 51-11R of
the Washington Administrative Code (WAC) is adopted as the Energy Code for the
unincorporated areas of Pierce County. The effective date of subsequent editions of the
Washington State Energy Code in Pierce County shall coincide with the effective date of their
adoption and amendment by the State Building Code Council.

17C.70.020  Violations.
WAC 54-H-0106-51-11-C110 and WAC 51-11R-R110 is-are deleted.
See Seetion-PCC 17C.10.050, "Violation and Penalties."

17C.70.030  Means of Appeal.
WAC 51-11-C110 and WAC 51-11R-R110 are deleted. See PCC 17C.10.060, "Appeals."

Pierce County Council
Page 43 of 44 930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 aj‘

Tacoma, VWA 98402 &

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s &



O 0O NOULL B WN B

[ N
U bd WNRO

Chapter 17C.75

INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE

over-the published provisions-of the International Swimmineg Pooland-Spa-Code-The edition of
the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, currently or hereafter adopted and amended by
the State Building Code Council and included in Title 51 of the Washington Administrative
Code, is adopted as the Swimming Pool and Spa Code of the International Swimming Pool and
Spa Code.

Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pioros County Coundil (Bl
Page 44 of 44 930 Tacoma Avt:S_Rm 1046 g&@@

Tacoma, WA 98402 v%fé;,u,ﬂ,.j;??



O NO O~ WN -~

A A DDA DADNDEDNOWWWOWOWWWW®WRNNRNRNNMNMNNNMNRN-S A A a2 a3 2 oA a o
NOoOORWOWDN 20O OO NN RINAOOARNOODAROIN-AOOONODAN®N-= O ©

Exhibit B to Ordinance No. 2021-46s

FINDINGS OF FACT

The Pierce County Council finds that:

1.

10.

Pierce County has adopted uniform standards for building construction, fire
prevention, and building maintenance. These regulations are found in Title 17C of
the Pierce County Code (PCC).

The building, fire, and maintenance codes found in Title 17C PCC need to be
periodically updated to ensure conformity with national and state standards.

Any jurisdiction may amend the State Building Code, provided the amendments do
not reduce the minimum performance standards of the codes.

The Pierce County Sustainability 2030 plan promotes the transition to electric
vehicles as a strategy for reducing transportation generated greenhouse gas
emissions.

Providing electric vehicle charging readiness at the time of construction of new one-
and two-family dwellings supports increased use of electric vehicles and is more
cost effective than retrofitting a structure with electric vehicle charging capability
after construction is complete.

The cost of providing an electric vehicle ready space in new one- and two-family
construction is estimated to be $50 to $300 per space. Retrofitting an existing
structure with electric vehicle charging readiness is estimated to be 200 to 800
percent more expensive than the cost of providing electric vehicle charging
readiness at time of building construction.

The "International Residential Code" (Chapter 17C.30 PCC) is amended to require
electric vehicle charging readiness for new one- and two-family dwellings.

Chapter 17C.60 PCC, International Fire Code, is amended to require additional fire
protection features to prevent fire spread and decrease fire damage to single-family
development where structures have a separation of less than 10 feet.

It is in the best interest of the citizens of Pierce County and necessary and
appropriate to protect the health, safety, and welfare of the citizens to adopt these
amendments.

The amendments are categorically exempt from SEPA as a nonproject action under
RCW 43.21C.450(4), as these amendments are related to technical codes to
ensure consistency with minimum standards contained in state law.

Exhibit B to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council {

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 104
Page 1 Of 2 Tacoma, WA 98402



o O WN -

11. On June 7, 2021, the Pierce County Council Community Development Committee
reviewed the proposed amendments to the Building and Fire Codes in a public
hearing; and on June 7, 2021, the Pierce County Council Community Development
Committee made final recommendations to the Pierce County Council in a public
hearing.

Exhibit B to Ordinance No. 2021-46s Pierce County Council

930 Tacoma Ave S, Rm 1046 %
Page 20f2 Tacoma, WA 98402 °




